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2.6 Civic Responsibility:  
Definition Civic 
Responsibility is a habit of 
mind demonstrated by 
exercising responsible 
citizenship, promoting the 
quality of life in a 
community through 
political or nonpolitical 
processes, comparing 
personal and public 
concerns, and/or 
respecting the views or 
rights of others. Criteria • 
Civic Knowledge • Civic 
Engagement • Promoting 
the quality of life in a 
community through 
political or nonpolitical 
processes • Comparing 
personal and public 
concerns • Respecting the 
views or rights of others 
4.2 Collaboration:  
Definition The ability to 
mobilize or work with 
others to solve a real-
world challenge. Criteria • 
Contributes to Team • 
Facilitates the 
Contributions of Team 
Members • Individual 

Graduates take 
responsibility for their 
actions and understand 
their roles in the 
community. They engage 
in their communities by 
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